GO~ O B P o—

N N L O - U VS BV VL VS R VA IRV BT SR VSRS B (O I 0 L0 6 B L R\ SR S 2 B ol e e e e s e e ey
B WN e DODWe -1 WND L, OO LNDP OV -1 i — OO

Attachment 1
ORDINANCE NO. XXX

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF CALISTOGA, COUNTY OF
NAPA, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, REPEALING TITLE 15, CALIFORNIA BUILDING
STANDARDS, SPECIFICALLY, CHAPTERS: 15.01 GENERAL PROVISIONS, 15.04
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE, 15.08 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 15.12 CALIFORNIA
EILECTRICAL CODE, 15.16 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE, 15.20 UNIFORM
PLUMBING CODE, 15.24 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE, 15.28 CALIFORNIA
HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE, 15.32 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, 15.36 CALIFORNIA
EXISTING BUILDING CODE, 15.40 CALIFORNIA REFERENCE STANDARDS, 15.44
UNIFORM CODE FOR THE ABATEMENT OF DANGEROUS BUILDINGS, AND 15.48
UNIFORM HOUSING CODE OF THE CALISTOGA MUNICIPAL CODE, AND ADOPTING
THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, TITLE 24, AS ADOPTED BY
THE CALIFORNIA STATE BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Calistoga at its regular meeting of
, 2010 and , 2010 considered as one of its items of
business, noticed in accordance with Government Code Sections 65090 and 50022.3, this
ordinance to be adopted in accordance with Government Code Section 65850;

WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Commission completed the adoption
and approval of the California Building Standards Code on July 1, 2010;

WHEREAS, the International Code Council (ICC) has published these model codes
that provide jurisdictions such as the City of Calistoga with a complete set of model
building-related regulations for adoption. These model codes are updated approximately
every three years to reflect the development of improved building construction techniques;

WHEREAS, the California codes were last adopted on November 6, 2007 when the
City Council passed Ordinance No. 646 adopting the 2007 California Building Standards
Code and related family of codes;

WHEREAS, the Calistoga Building Standards Advisory and Appeals Board at their
meeting of September 30, 2010 considered as one of its items of business staff
recommendations on the 2010 California Building Standards Code and recommended
approval to the City Council;

WHEREAS, the City Council is hereby repealing Title 15, California Building
Standards, specifically Chapters: 15.01 General Provisions, 15.04 Administrative Code,
15,08 California Building Code, 15.12 California Electrical Code, 15.16 California
Mechanical Code, 15.20 Uniform Plumbing Code, 15.24 California Energy Code, 15.28
California Historical Building Code, 15.32 California Fire Code, 15.36 California Existing
Building Code, 15.40 California Reference Standards, 15.44 Uniform Code for the
Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, and 15.48 Uniform Housing Code of the Calistoga
Municipal Code, to include the 2010 California Building Standards Code, Title 24 of the
California Code of Regulations, as adopted by the State Building Standards Commission;



46
47
48
49
50
51
52
53
54
55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62
63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70
71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78
79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86
87
88
89
90
91
92
93

WHEREAS, the City Council finds that in order to best protect the health, safety and
welfare of the citizens of the Calistoga, the building standards within the community should
comply with State law, except for certain modifications and amendments to the model
codes that are based on local climatic, geographical and/or topographical conditions;

WHEREAS, the City Council further finds that use of the most up-to-date California
codes is necessary and proper to ensure uniformity in the implementation of building
regulations for new construction, alteration, repair, demolition, maintenance, and use of any
building or structure in the City of Calistoga; and

WHEREAS, the City Council, based on the materials presented and
recommendations of the Building Official, Fire Chief, Planning and Building Director and the
Building Standards Advisory and Appeals Board of the City of Calistoga, finds that it is
necessary o make procedural and administrative modifications to the model codes as
allowed under California Health and Safety Code Section 17958.

The City Council of the City of Calistoga does ordain as follows:

SECTION ONE: Adoption

The City Council of the City of Calistoga adopts this Ordinance repealing Title 15,
California Building Standards, specifically Chapters: 15.01 General Provisions, 15.04
Administrative Code, 15.08 California Building Code, 15.12 California Electrical Code,
15.16 California Mechanical Code, 15.20 Uniform Plumbing Code, 15.24 California Energy
Code, 15.28 California Historical Building Code, 15.32 California Fire Code, 15.36
California Existing Building Code, 15.40 California Reference Standards, 15.44 Uniform
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, and 15.48 Uniform Housing Code of the
Calistoga Municipal Code, and adopting and replacing Title 15 with the 2010 California
Building Standards Code, Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, as adopted by the
State Building Standards Commission as follows: 2010 California Administrative Code (Part
1 of Title 24); 2010 California Building Code (Part 2 of Title 24, Volumes 1 and 2); 2010
California Residential Code (Part 2.5 of Title 24); 2010 California Electrical Code (Part 3 of
Title 24); 2010 California Mechanical Code (Part 4 of Title 24); 2010 California Plumbing
Code (Part 5 of Title 24); 2010 California Energy Code (Part 6 of Title 24); 2010 California
Historical Building Code (Part 8 of Title 24); 2010 California Fire Code (Part 9 of Titie 24};
2010 California Existing Building Code (Part 10 of Title 24); 2010 California Green Building
Standards Code (Part 11 of Title 24); 2010 California Referenced Standards Code (Part 12
of Title 24).

SECTION TWO: Findings

A. The City Council of the City of Calisioga finds that in order to best protect the
health, safety and welfare of the citizens of the City of Calistoga, the standards of building
within the City must conform with State law except where local conditions warrant more
restrictive regulations.

B. Pursuant to Section 17958 of the California Health and Safety Code, the
governing body of the City of Calistoga, in its ordinance adopting the State Building

Page 2 of 19



94

95

96

97

98

99
100
101
102
103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110
111
112
113
114
115
116
117
118
119
120
121
122
123
124
125
126
127
128
129
130
131
132
133
134
135
136
137
138
139
140
141

Standards Code and uniform industry codes, may establish amendments which are more
restrictive in nature than those regulations adopted by the State of California commonly
referred to as Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations. Based on the materials
presented and by the recommendation of the Building Official, the Fire Chief, the Planning
& Building Director and the Calistoga Building Standards Advisory and Appeals Board, the
City Council further finds that it is necessary to make modifications to the California
Building Standards Code and to adopt or not adopt certain appendices to the Code. Under
the provisions of Section 17958.5 of the California Health and Safety Code, local
amendments shall be based on climatic, geographical and topographical conditions. As
such, the City Council finds that the following local conditions exist:

1. Climate. The City, on an average, experiences an approximate annual
rainfall of 38 inches. This rainfall can normally be expected between October
and April. During the winter months, the City may experience periods of
heavy rain, which causes local fiooding, erosion and contributes to slope
instability. Winter storms are often accompanied by high winds, which have
uprooted trees and damaged power lines. The City has also experienced
periodical days of heavy fog, which could delay the response time for fire
fighting apparatus, and prevent early discovery of structure fires.

Wind is a factor in the spread of fire in that burning embers are carried with
the wind to adjacent exposed areas. Calistoga has a characteristic southerly
wind, which originates from the San Francisco Bay and becomes a factor in
the control of fires. Further, in the dry season, Calistoga experiences an
occasional north wind of significant velocity, which is recognized by Fire
Officials to be a significant concern with regard to fire spread.

During the dry period, temperatures range from 70 degrees to over 100
degrees. These temperatures are often accompanied by a wildland-urban
interface, creating a hazardous fire condition. With increased deveiopment
spreading into the brush covered foothill areas, wind driven fires could have
severe consequences, as has been demonstrated on several occasions
throughout the State.

2. Geographical. The City is susceptible to seismic hazards resulting from
movement along any one of several known faults in the area. The most
serious direct earthquake hazard threat is from the damage or collapse of
buildings and other structures due to ground movement. In addition to
damage caused by earthquakes, there is a possibility of earthquake-induced
landslides. Fire is often the major form of damage resulting from
earthquakes. Most earthquake-induced fires start because of damage to gas
lines, power lines or heat producing appliances. Such fires expose residential
and other development within the City to an increased risk of conflagration. In
addition, unstable slopes have been identified in the City, which present a
significant potential for landslides. In the event of a major earthquake or
landslide, many areas of the City may not be accessible to emergency
equipment and, if bridges or roads are damaged, the City may be isolated
from outside assistance. Several areas within the City of Calistoga offer poor

Page 3 of 19



142
143
144
145
146
147
148
149
150
151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158
159
160
161
162
163
164
165
166
167
168
169
170
171
172
173
174
175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182
183
184
185
186
187
188
189

access for the delivery of public safety services because of the severity of
slopes and the existence of natural barriers such as the Napa River and its
tributaries such as Garnett Creek and Cyrus Creek.

Topographical. The City borders include hilly terrain on the southwest
portions of the City. The roadway systems in these hills are designed around
the lay of the land with respect to narrow, winding and steep access ways.
The grades of these roadways sometimes exceed 25% and road widths of
less than 12 feet are not uncommon. The Napa River and other small water
ways run directly through the City and could impact emergency response
during disasters. The water supply within the City is directly affected by the
topographical layout. The water distribution system consists of pressure
zones, which carry water by gravity from various reservoirs. Water flow within
the City can vary from less than 100 gallons per minute fo flows in excess of
1,000 gallons per minute. This wide variation causes major problems to
development as well as to fire suppression efforts. The hilly terrain
contributes to drainage, erosion and slope instability probilems for some
development.

SECTION THREE: Titie 15, California Building Standards Codes, repealed and adopted.

Title 15 California Building Standard Codes of the Calistoga Municipal Code is
hereby repealed and adopted to read as follows:

Chapters:

15.01
15.04
15.08
15.12
15.16
15.20
15.24
15.28
15.32
15.36
15.40
15.44
15.48
15.50
15.52

Title 15

CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODES

General Provisions

2010 California Administrative Code, Part 1 of Title 24

2010 California Building Code, Part 2 of Title 24 (Volumes 1 & 2)
2010 California Residential Code Part 2.5 of Title 24

2010 California Electrical Code, Part 3 of Title 24

2010 California Mechanical Code, Part 4 of Title 24

2010 California Plumbing Code, Part 5 of Title 24

2010 California Energy Code, Part 6 of Title 24

2010 California Historical Building Code, Part 8 of Title 24

2010 California Fire Code, Part 9 of Title 24

2010 California Existing Building Code, Part 10 of Title 24

2010 California Green Building Standards Code, Part 11 of Title 24
2010 California Referenced Standards, Part 12 of Title 24
Building Standards Advisory and Appeals Board

Violations

Page 4 of 19



190
191
192
193
194
195
196
197
198
199
200
201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213
214
215
216
217
218
219
220
221
222
223
224
225
226
227
228
229
230
231
232
233
234
235
236
237

Chapter 15.01
GENERAL PROVISIONS

Sections:

15.01.010  Scope
15.01.020  Building Division

15.01.010 Scope

The provisions of this chapter shall apply to all buildings and structures located in
the City.

15.01.020 Building Division

A There is established a Building Division for the City to perform technical building
inspections, code enforcement, plan check, mobile home inspection and cross connection
control services; and to enforce state mandated codes related to construction.

B. The Building Official thereof shail supervise and have charge of all permit issuance

and inspections of work relating to, and the enforcement of the construction regulations
adopted in this chapter.

Chapter 15.04
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
Sections:
15.04.010 Adoption
For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for the administration of the

various codes covered in this Title, the 2010 California Administrative Code, is adopted and
made a part of this code by reference.

Chapter 15.08

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE

Sections:
15.08.010 Adoption
15.08.020 Amendments

Page 5 of 19



238
239
240
241
242
243
244
245
246
247
248
249
250
251
252
253
254
255
256
257
258
259
260
261
262
263
264
205
206
267
268
269
270
271
272
273
274
275
276
277
278
279
280
281
282
283
284
285

15.08.010 Adoption

For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction, the 2010
California Building Code, Vol. 1 & 2, Appendix A (Employee Qualifications), Appendix F
(Rodentproofing), Appendix G (Flood-Resistant Construction), Appendix H (Signs),

Appendix | (Patio Covers), Appendix J (Grading), referred to as the “International Buiiding
Code” or “IBC,” is adopted as amended and made a part of this code by reference.

Chapter 15.12
CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE

Sections:

15.12.010  Adoption
15.12.010 Adoption

For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction, the 2010
California Residential Code, Appendix A (Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping), Appendix F
(Radon Control Methods), Appendix G (Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs), Appendix H
(Patio Covers), Appendix J ( Existing Buildings and Structures), Appendix P (Sizing of

Water Piping System), referred to as the “International Building Code” or “IBC,” is adopted
as amended and made a part of this code by reference.

Chapter 15.16
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE
Sections:
15.16.010  Adoption
15.16.010 Adoption
For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction and for
installation of electrical systems, the 2010 California Electrical Code, otherwise identified as

the National Electrical Code, 2008 Edition, referred to as the “National Electrical Code”
(NEC) is adopted and made a part of this code by reference.

Page 6 of 19



286
287
288
289
290
291
292
293
294
295
296
297
298
299
300
301
302
303
304
305
306
307
308
309
310
311
312
313
314
315
316
317
318
319
320
321
322
323
324
325
326
327
328
329
330
331
332
333

Chapter 15.20
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE
Sections:
15.20.010 Adoption
15.20.010 Adoption
For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building consiruction and for
the installation of mechanical systems, the 2010 California Mechanical Code, otherwise
identified as the Uniform Mechanical Code, 2009 Edition, and referred to as the “Uniform
Mechanical Code” or “UMC,” is adopted and made a part of this code by reference.
Chapter 15.24
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE
Sections:
15.24.010 Adoption
15.24.010 Adoption
For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction and for
the installation of plumbing systems, the 2010 California Plumbing Code, including
Appendix A (Recommended Rules for Sizing the Water Supply System), Appendix B
(Explanatory Notes on Combination Waste and Vent System), Appendix D (Sizing Storm
Water Drainage System), Appendix G (Graywater Systems), Appendix | (Installation
Standards),otherwise identified as the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2009 Edition, and referred
to as the “Uniform Plumbing Code,” or “UPC,” is adopted and made a part of this code by
reference.
Chapter 15.28
CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE
Sections:
15.28.010 Adoption
15.28.010 Adoption
For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction and

energy conservation, the 2010 Energy Code is adopted and made a part of this code by
reference.

Page 7 of 19



334
335
336
337
338
339
340
341
342
343
344
345
346
347
348
349
350
351
352
353
354
355
356
357
358
359
360
361
362
363
364
365
366
367
368
369
370
371
372
373
374
375
376
377
378
379

Chapter 15.32
CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE
Sections:
15.32.010  Adoption
15.32.010 Adoption

For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction as it
relates to historical buildings, the 2010 California Historical Building Code is adopted and
made a part of this code by reference.

Chapter 15.36
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
Sections:

15.32.010  Adoption
15,32.020 Definitions
15.32.030 Amendmenis

15.32.010 Adoption

For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction, the 2010
California Fire Code, Appendix B and Appendix BB (Fire Flow Requirements for Buildings),
Appendix C and Appendix CC (Fire Hydrant Locations and Distribution), Appendix D (Fire
Apparatus Access Roads), Appendix E (Hazard Categories), Appendix F (Hazard
Ranking), Appendix G (Cryogenic Fluids-Weight and Volume Equivalenis), Appendix H
(Hazardous Materials Management Plans and Hazardous Inventory Statement), Appendix |
(Fire Protection Systems—Noncompliant Conditions), Appendix J (Emergency Responder
Radio Coverage) and referred to as the “International Fire Code” or “IFC,” is adopted as
amended and made a part of this code by reference.

15.32.020 Definitions

For the purposes of this chapter, the words in this Chapter shall have the following
meaning:;

A.  Wherever the word "jurisdiction” is used in the California Fire Code, it shall refer to the
City of Calistoga.

Page 8 of 19



380
381
382
383
384
385
386
387
388
389
390
391
392
393
394
395
396
397
398
399
400
401
402
403
404
403
406
407
408
409
410
411
412
413
414
415
416
417
418
419
420
421
422
423
424
425
426
427

Where the party responsible for the enforcement of the California Fire Code is given
the title of "Fire Marshal" it shall refer to the City of Calistoga Fire Chief or his/her
designee.

15.32.030 Amendmenis

The California Fire Code shall be amended to read as follows:

Amend Chapter 1, Division || Administration, Part 1 General Provisions, Section 102
Applicability. Section 102.1 Construction and Design Provisions is amended by
adding the following:

102.1 Construction and design provisions.

5. Existing structures to which additions, alterations or repairs are made that
involve: the addition, removal or replacement of fire resistive construction related
to property lines; additions, alteration or repairs to fire protection systems,
additions or alterations made that impact emergency vehicle access; or
alterations made that impact the egress system.

Amend Chapter 1, Division Il Administration, Part 2 Administrative Provisions,
Section 105 Permits. Section 105.6.47 Additional Permits is amended by adding the
following:

105.6.47 Additional permits.

in addition to the operational permits required by Section 105.6, the following
permits shall be obtained from the Building Division prior to engaging in the following
activities, operations, practices or functions:

4. Apartment, Hotel, Motel and Bed & Breakfast. An operational permit is required
to operate an apartment house, hotel, motel and bed & breakfast.

5. Day Care. An operational permit is required to operate a day care occupancy
with an occupant load over eight (8) persons.

6. Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System. An operational permit is
required for buildings and/or facilities with emergency responder radio coverage
systems and related equipment.

7. Winery Caves — Public Accessible. An operational permit is required fo operate a
winery cave that is accessible to the public.

Amend Chapter 1, Division Il Administration, Part 2 Administrative Provisions,
Section 109 Violations. Section 109.3 Violation Penalties is amended to read as
follows:

109.3 Violation penalties.

Person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of
the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official,
or of permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a

Page 9 of 19



428
429
430
431
432
433
434
435
436
437
438
439
440
441
442
443
444
445
446
447
448
449
450
451
452
453
454
455
456
457
458
459
460
461
462
463
464
465
466
467
468
469
470
471
472
473
474
475

misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not less than $500.00, or by imprisonment
not exceeding six months, or both such fine and imprisonment. Each day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate
offense.

Amend Chapter 1, Division I, Adminisiration, Part 2 Administrative Provisions,
Section 111 Stop Work Order. Section 111.4 Failure to Comply is amended to read
as follows:

111.4 Failure to comply.

Any person, who shall continue ay work after having been served with a stop work
order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation
or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than $100.00 dollars or more
than $500.00 dollars. A person shall be fined for each day he or she continues to
work after having been served with a stop work order.

Amend Chapter 5 Fire Service Features, Section 505 Premises Identification.
Section 505.1 Address |dentification is amended to read as follows:

505.1 Address identification.

New and existing buildings shali have approved illuminated or reflective address
number, building numbers or approved building identification placed in a position
that is plainly legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property. These
numbers shall contrast with their background. Address numbers shall be Arabic
numbers or alphabetical letters. Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6mm)
high with a minimum stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7mm). Where access is by means
of private road and the building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument,
pole or other sign or means shall be used to identify the structure.

Amend Chapter 5 Fire Service Features, Section 510 Emergency Responder Radio
Coverage. Section 510.1 Emergency Responder Radio Coverage in Buildings is
amended to read as foliows:

510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in buildings.

All buildings and winery caves shall have approved radio coverage for emergency
responders within the building or winery cave based upon the existing coverage
levels of public safety communication systems of the jurisdiction, at the exterior of
the building. This section shall not require improvement of existing public safety
communication systems.

Exceptions:

1. Where approved by the building official and the fire code official, a wired
communication system in accordance with Section 907.2.13.2 may be
permitted to be installed in lieu of an approved radio coverage system.

2. Where it is determined by the fire code official that the radio coverage system
is not necessary.

Page 10 of 19



476
477
478
479
480
481
482
483
484
485
486
487
488
489
490
491
492
493
494
495
496
497
498
499
500
501
502
503
504
505
506
507
508
509
510
511
512
513
514
515
516
517
518
519
520
521
522
523

Amend Chapter 6 Building Services and Systems, Section 605 Electrical Equipment,
Wiring and Hazards. Section 605 is amended by adding the following:

605.11 Solar photovoltaic installations.

605.11.1 Marking. PV systems must be marked. Marking is needed to provide
emergency responders with appropriate warning and guidance with respect to
working around and isolating the solar electric system. This can facilitate identifying
energized electrical lines that connect the solar modules to the inverter, as these
shall not be cut when venting for smoke removal. Materials used for marking must
be weather resistant. It is required that Underwriters Laboratories Marking and
Labeling System 969 (UL 969) be used as standard to determine weather rating.

605.11.1.1 Main service disconnect. For both commercial and residential
applications, the marking of the AC shut off devices and shall be placed adjacent
to the main service disconnect in a location clearly visible from the location where
the lever is operated.

For integrated systems, a sign at the main panel shall state the following as
outlined in Section 605.11.1.2.1 below:

CAUTION: INTEGRATED PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEM ON SITE!

605.11.1.1.1 Marking content and format.

Marking content: CAUTION: SOLAR ELECTRIC SYSTEM.

Red background.

White lettering.

Minimum 3/8" letter height.

All capital letters.

Arial or similar font, non-bold.

Reflective, weather resistant material suitable for the environment (durable
adhesive materials may meet this requirement).

@ 000U

605.11.1.2 Marking for direct current conduit, raceways, enclosures, cable
assemblies, and junction boxes. Marking is required on all interior and exterior
DC conduit, raceways, enclosures, cable assemblies, and junction boxes to alert
the Fire Service to avoid cutting them. Marking shall be placed on all interior and
exterior DC conduit, raceways, enclosures, and cable assemblies, every 10 feet,
at turns and above and/or below penetrations and all DC combiner and junction
boxes.

6.05.11.1.2.1 Marking content and format.
Marking content: CAUTION: SOLAR CIRCUIT.
Red background.

White lettering.

Minimum 3/8” letter height.

All capital letters.

Arial or similar font, non-bold.

P oo T

Page 11 of 19



324
525
526
527
528
529
530
531
532
533
534
535
536
537
538
539
540
541
542
543
544
545
546
547
548
549
550
551
552
553
554
555
556
557
558
559
560
561
562
563
564
565

566
567
568
569
570
571

g. Reflective, weather resistant material suitable for the environment (durable
adhesive materials meet this requirement).

605.11.1.3 Inverters. The inverter is a device used to convert DC electricity from
the solar system to AC electricity for use in the building’s electrical system or the
grid. For example:

CAUTION: SOLAR CIRCUIT

CAUTION: SOLAR ELECTRIC SYSTEM
INVERTER LOCATED IN

605.11.2 Access, pathways and smoke ventilation. Access and spacing
requirements shall be observed in order to:

a. Ensure access to the roof.

b. Provide pathways fo specific areas of the roof.
¢. Provide for smoke ventilation opportunities area.
d. Provide emergency egress from the roof.

The Fire Chief or Building Official may allow exceptions to this requirement where
access, pathway or ventilation requirements are reduced due to:

Proximity and type of adjacent exposures.

Alternative access opportunities (as from adjoining roofs).

Ground level access 1o the roof area in question.

Adequate ventilation opportunities beneath solar array (as with significantly
elevated or widely-spaced arrays).

Adequate ventilation opportunities afforded by module set back from other rooftop
equipment (example: shading or structural constraints may leave significant areas
open for ventilation near HVAC equipment).

j. Automatic ventilation device.

k. New technology, methods, or other innovations that ensure adequate fire
department access, pathways and ventilation opportunities.

>@ o

Designation of ridge, hip, and vailey does not apply to roofs with 2-in-12 or less
pitch. All roof dimensions are measured to centerlines.

Roof access points shall be defined as areas where ladders are not placed over
openings (i.e., windows or doors) and are located at strong points of building
construction and in locations where they will not conflict with overhead obstructions
(i.e., tree limbs, wires, or signs).

605.11.2.1 Residential systems - single and two-unit residential dwellings.
Plan review is required on all residential systems.

Page 12 0of 19



572
573
574
575
576
377
578
579
580
581
582
583
584
585
586
587
588
589
590
591
562
593
594
595
596
597
598
599
600
601
602
603
604
605
606
607
608
609
610
611
612
613
614
615
616
617
618
619

605.11.2.1.1 Access/Pathways.

a. Residential buildings with hip roof layouts: Modules shall be located in a
manner that provides one (1) three-foot (3’) wide clear access pathway
from the eave to the ridge on each roof slope where modules are located.
The access pathway shall be located at a structurally strong location on
the building (such as a bearing wall).

b. Residential buildings with a single ridge: Modules shall be located in a
manner that provides two (2) three-foot (3') wide access pathways from
the eave to the ridge on each roof slope where modules are located.

c. Hips and Valleys: Modules shall be located no closer than one and one
half (1.5) feet to a hip or a valley if modules are to be placed on both sides
of a hip or valley. If the modules are to be located on only one side of a
hip or valley that is of equal length then the modules shall be placed
directly adjacent to the hip or valley.

605.11.2.1.2 Smoke ventilation. The modules shall be located no higher
than three feet (3’) below the ridge.

605.11.2.2 Commercial buildings and residential housing comprised of
three (3) or more units. Plan review is required on all commercial systems.

Exception: If the Fire Chief or Building Official determines that the roof
configuration is similar to residential (such as in the case of townhouses,
condominiums, or single family attached buildings), a determination to apply the
residential access and ventilation requirements may be granted. Examples of
these requirements appear at the end of this policy.

605.11.2.2.1 Access. There shall be a minimum six foot (6') wide clear
perimeter around the edges of the roof.

Exception: If either axis of the building is 250 feet or less, there shall be a
minimum four feet (4") wide ciear perimeter around the edges of the roof.

605.11.2.2.2 Pathways. Pathways shall be established in the design of the
solar installation. Pathways shall meet the following requirements:

a. Shall be over structural members.

b. Centerline axis pathways shall be provided in both axis of the roof.
Centerline axis pathways shall run on structural members or over the next
closest structural member nearest to the center lines of the roof.

c. Shall be straight line not less than 4 feet (4') clear to skylights and/or
ventilation hatches.

d. Shall be straight line not less than 4 feet (4°) clear to roof standpipes.

e. Shall provide not less than 4 feet (4') clear around roof access hatch with
at least one not less than 4 feet (4') clear pathway to parapet or roof edge.

605.11.2.2.3 Smoke ventilation.
a. Arrays shall be no greater than 150 by 150 feet in distance in either axis.

Page 13 of 19



620
621
622
623
624
625
626
627
628
629
630
631
632
633
634
635
636
637
638
639
640
641
642
643
644
645
646
647
648
649
650
651
652
653
654
655
656
657
658
659
660
661
662
663
664
665
666
667

b. Ventilation options between array sections shall be one of the following:
1. A pathway 8 feet (8’) or greater in width.
2. Four feet (4) or greater in width pathway and bordering on existing
roof skylights or ventilation hatches.
3. Four feet (4") or greater in width pathway and bordering four feet (4’) x
8 feet 8 “venting cutouts” every 20 feet (20°) on alternating sides of the
pathway.

605.11.3 Location of direct current (DC) conductors. Conduit, wiring systems,
and raceways for photovoltaic circuits shall be located as close as possible to the
ridge or hip or valley and from the hip or valley as directly as possible to an outside
wall to reduce trip hazards and maximize ventilation opportunities. Conduit runs
between sub arrays and to DC combiner boxes shall use design criteria that
minimize total amount of conduit on the roof by taking the shortest path from the
array to the DC combiner box. The DC combiner boxes are to be located such that
conduit runs are minimized in the pathways between arrays. To limit the hazard of
cutting live conduit in venting operations, DC wiring shall be run in metallic conduit or
raceways when located within enclosed specs in a building and shall be run, to the
maximum extent possible, along the bottom of load-bearing members.

605.11.4 Location alternating current (AC) and direct current (DC) shut off
devices.

605.11.4.1 DC shut off device. A DC shut off device approved by the California
Electric Code shall be installed as close to the PV modules as possible. Proper
marking as described in Section 605.11.1 shalt be provided.

605.11.4.2 AC shut off device. An AC shut off device approved by the California
Electric Code shall be installed near the main service panel in line with the
inverter.

605.11.5. Non-habitable buildings. Not applicable to this section. Examples of
non-habitable structures include, but are not limited to, parking shade structures,
solar trellises, etfc.

605.11.6 Ground mounted photovoltaic arrays. Ground-mounted, freestanding
photovoltaic arrays are subject to the setback and height requirements for accessory
structures as specified in CMC Title 17 Zoning. A clear brush area of ten feet (10') is
required for ground mounted photovoltaic arrays.

605.11.7 Roofing materials. Roofing material instalied under the arrays shall be
Class A material throughout as defined by the current edition of the California
Building Code.

Amend Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems, Section 903 Automatic Sprinkler
Systems. Section 903.2 Where Required is amended by adding the following:

Page 14 0of 19



668
669
670
671
672
673
674
675
676
677
678
679
680
681
682
683
684
685
686
687
688
689
690
691
692
693
694
695
696
697
698
699
760
701
702
703
704
705
706
707
708
709
710
711
712
713
714
715

803.2.19 Additions & alterations.

If deemed necessary by the Fire Code Official additions to existing residential and
non-residential buildings that increase the square footage by 50% of the existing
gross floor area and/or results in the building exceeding 3,600 square feet shall be
installed with an automatic fire sprinkler system throughout.

903.2.20 Repairs.

For the purposes of this section for automatic fire sprinkler system requirements,
and if deemed necessary by the Fire Code Official, repairs to existing buildings that
have sustained damage of more than 50% of the floor area or more than 50% of the
value of the building shall meet the requirements for a new building.

903.2.21 Change in cccupancy.

For the purposes of this section for automatic fire sprinkler system requirements, a
proposed change in use or occupancy to an existing building that would result in a
more hazardous use or occupancy shall meet the requirements for a new building.

Amend Chapter 49 Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas. Section
4903 Plans is amended by adding the following:

SECTION 4903 PLANS.

4903.1. General. A Wildland Fire Protection Plan (WFPP) shall be submitted by
licensed or registered fire protection specialists/consultant knowledgeable in the field
of Wildland Urban Interface Fire Protection.

4903.2. Requirements. The following requirements shall be included in the WFPP:

4903.2.1 Sheltering in place (SIP). During a wildfire, SiP shall be considered if
the homes and community as a whole can meet all of the following features:

Constructed of ignition resistant materials.

Protected eaves.

Residential fire sprinklers.

Maintain fire resistive landscape with a minimum 100-foot defensible space
surrounding all structures.

Class “A” non-combustible roof assembly.

Dual pane or tempered glass windows.

Chimneys with spark arrestors ¥z inch screening.

Adequate roadway and driveway widths — meeting designed standards.
Adequate water supply and water flow for firefighting (2,500 gpm).
Vegetation-modification zones and fire department approved landscape
plans.

0o oo

T e o

4903.2.2 Water supply. List parcel size, required hydrant spacing, required flow
for firefighting (2,500 GPM in Wildland Interface Areas), and show existing and
proposed hydrant locations.

Page 15 0of 19



716
717
718
719
720
721
722
723
724
725
726
727
728
729
730
731
732
733
734
735
736
737
738
739
740
741
742
743
744
745
746
747
748
749
750
751
752
753
754
755
756
757
758
759
760
761
762
763

4903.2.3 Fire access. Address main access, secondary access, road width,
driving surface improvement, capacity (weight of fire apparatus is 75,000 Ibs),
grade, angle of approach/departure, obstructions, gates, fire lane marking,
turnarounds meeting Fire Department design template, and on-going
maintenance of these elements.

Note: If the project can not provide secondary access, the applicant shall provide
alternatives or justify why it is not needed.

Individual property owners are responsible for maintaining driveways, gates and
signs on their own parcel in compliance with fire codes. Private roads and other
access components, including gates and signs within the project shall also be
maintained in compliance with fire codes in perpetuity. Identify what entity (not a
named individual) is responsible for on-going road maintenance, and how that
will be funded and monitored.

Address all of the following:

a. Organization responsible for road maintenance (cannot be dissolved or
unfunded).

b. Funding obligation, which shall be shared by all project owners.

c. Responsibility to participate conveyed with property transfer.

d. Failure to maintain road eiements in compliance with fire codes subjects
owners to potential fines and forced abatement by the fire agency or the
County, with charges, including administrative costs and penalties, liened
against the property.

4903.2.4 Urban wildland interface area. This is land in an area designated or
identified as a Hazardous Fire Area. Hazardous Fire Area is any geographic
area mapped by the State or the City of Calistoga as a high or very high fire
hazard area, or as set forth by the City of Calistoga that contains the type and
condition of vegetation, topography, weather, and structure density to potentially
increase the possibility of vegetation conflagration fires. (Refer to City Council
Resolution #2008-104 for map of the City of Calistoga’'s Fire Hazard Severity
Zone.)

4903.2.5 Fire protection systems. Fire sprinklers are required for all newly
constructed buildings.

4903.2.6 Defensible space. Address code minimums (100 feet) and show
proposed modifications. If the fire behavior model (Refer to Section 49803.2.8)
indicates a greater distance, incorporate it here and reference the fire modeling.

4903.2.7 Vegetation management. Discuss how fuel modification will be
maintained. Indicate who the responsible party is (individual property owner or
other entity) and how this will be handled in perpetuity. It is not acceptable to
have an association charged with the task if that organization can dissolve itself
or become ineffective for lack of funding. Individual property owners are
responsible for maintaining their own parcel in compliance with fire codes.

Page 16 of' 19



764
765
766
767
768
769
770
771
772
773
774
775
776
777
778
779
780
781
782
783
784
785
786
787
788
789
790
791
792
793
794
795
796
797
798
799
800
801
802
803
804
805
806
807
808
809
810
811

Parcels of open space easements, road easements, and similar land uses within
the project shall also have vegetation maintained in a fire-safe manner in
perpetuity. Identify which entity (not a named individual) is responsible for on-
going vegetation maintenance and how that will be funded and monitored.

Address all of the following:

Organization responsible for maintenance (cannot be dissolved or unfunded).
Funding obligation, which shall be shared by all project owners.
Responsibility to participate conveyed with property transfer.

Failure to maintain in fire-safe manner subjects owners to potential fines, and
forced abatement by the City of Calistoga Fire Department, with charges,
including administrative costs and penalties, liened against the property.

00T

4903.2.8 Fire behavior model. I|dentify the specific model and version being
used. Clearly identify your source for worst-case and summer and fall weather
conditions. Ensure all additional supplemental information is included, such as
product examples or clearing methods and is in full compliance with the
California Building Standards Codes and local amendments.
Chapter 15.40
CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE
Sections:
15.40.010 Adoption
15.40.010 Adoption
For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction, the 2010
California Existing Building Code otherwise identified as the International Existing Building
Code, 2009 Edition, and referred to as the “International Existing Building Code,” or “IEBC,”
is adopted and made a part of this code by reference.
Chapter 15.44
CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS
Sections:
15.44.010 Adoption
15.44.010 Adoption

For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction, the 2010
California Green Building Standards is adopted and made a part of this code by reference.

Page 17 0f 19



812
813
814
815
816
g17
818
819
820
821
822
823
824
825
826
827
828
829
830
831
832
833
834
835
836
837
838
839
340
841
842
843
844
845
846
847
848
849
850
851
852
853
854
855
856
857
858
859

Chapter 15.48
CALIFORNIA REFERENCE STANDARDS
Sections:
15.48.010 Adoption
15.48.010 Adoption

For the purpose of establishing proper regulations for building construction, the 2010
California Referenced Standards is adopted and made a part of this code by reference.

Chapter 15.50

BUILDING STANDARDS ADVISORY AND APPEALS BOARD

“Not Repealed & Amended”

Chapter 15.52
VIOLATIONS

“Not Repealed & Amended”

SECTION FIVE:

If any section or portion of this ordinance is for any reason held to be invalid and or
unconstitutional by a court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance.

SECTION SIX:

THIS ORDINANCE shall take effect. January 1, 2011. Before expiration of fifteen
(15) days after its passage by the City Council, the City Clerk shall cause to be published a
summary of this ordinance in a newspaper of general circulation within the City of
Calistoga.

Page 18 0f 19



860 THIS ORDINANCE was introduced with the first reading waived at the City of

861 Calistoga City Council meeting of the 2010 and was passed and
862 adopted at a regular meeting of the Calistoga City Council on the 2010,
863 by the following vote:

864

865 AYES:

866 NOES:

867 ABSTAIN:

868 ABSENT:

869

870

871 JACK GINGLES, Mayor

872

873 ATTEST:

874

875

876

877 SUSAN SNEDDON, City Clerk

Page 19 of 19



